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Lucille B. Rust, 64
HARLAN - Lucille Blanche Rust, daughter of William and Catherine

(VonTersch) Coenen, was born July 12, 1926 on a farm near Defiance. She
died at her home in Harlan, Aug. 25, 1990, at age 64 years, 1 month, and
13 days. She was baptized, received her First Communion, and confirmed
at St. Peter's Catholic Church at Defiance. She attended country school and
later St. Paul's Catholic School in Defiance, graduating in 1943. After high
school, she went to nurses training at Mercy Hospital in Co. Bluffs, and be-
came a Registered Nurse. She then was the County Health Nurse and
worked with Dr. Bisgaard at the original Harlan Hospital.

July 19, 1948, she married Paul Rust at St. Peter's Catholic Church at
Defiance. Four sons were born to this union. After they were married, they
lived in Defiance for a short time before moving to Harlan. She then worked
full time and on call at Myrtue Memorial Hospital. She was a member of St.
Michael's Catholic Church in Harlan.

In addition to her parents, she was preceded in death by one grand-
daughter, Carly; one sister, Irene, and two brothers, Gerald and Billy. She is
survived by her husband, Paul of Harlan; four sons, Bill (Cheryl) of Lee's
Summit, MO.; Bob (Jeanne) of LeMars; Roger (Pamela) of Harlan and Mike
(Pam) of Storm Lake; 12 grandchildren; two brothers, John Coenen (Marilyn)
of Defiance and Paul Coenen (Marie) of Harlan; nieces and nephews and
other relatives.

A Mass of Christian Burial was celebrated Aug. 27,1990 at St. Michael's
Catholic Church in Harlan with Rev. Edward Kelly as the celebrant. Burial
was in the Harlan cemetery with Joe Sondag, Travis Rust, Craig Kroger,
Greg Roecker, Thomas H. Ouren, and Larry A. Hilger serving as casket-
bearers. Pauley Funeral Home in charge of arrangements. /


