
Carl Wiese

IRWIN — Carl Frederick
Wiese was born Mar. 13,1902 near
Marne. At the age of 16 years he
came to the Irwin community
where he worked on various
farms. He married Leona
Andresen on June 26, 1929. They
have lived near Irwin unil 1962
when they moved into town. Carl
farmed and operated a truck.
After moving to town he was
custodian of Ruhs Park and for
the Senior Citizens home in Irwin.
He was active in the Senior
Citizens club activities. After
spending a week in the Harlan
hospital, Carl returned to his
home this last Saturday where he
died in his sleep early Sunday
morning, Febr. 20, 1977 at age 74
years, 11 months and seven days.

He was preceded in death by
his mother and step father and by
one step brother, Ed Kuchel.
Survivors include his wife, Leona,
three children, Lyla (Mrs Allan)
Thompson of Irwin, Ladelle (Mrs
Orlando) Hansen of Manilla and
Allan Wiese of Manning, nine
grandchildren, three great
grandchildren, one step-sister,
Mrs Alvina Andresen of Irwin,
three step brothers, Bill Kuchel,
Arcata, Calif., Albert Kuchel of
Manning and Harold Kuchel of
Walnut and other relatives.

. Funeral services were held
Wednesday, Febr. 23, 1977, at
Ohde Funeral home in Manilla
with Rev. J. Elmer Brunk of the
United Methodist church of Irwin
officiating. Burial was in Oak Hill
cemetery in Irwin with Roger
Wiese, Craig Thompson, Danny
Thompson, Jim Bexten, Sonny
Goans and Howard Kuchel ser-
ving as casketbearers.


