
Glee White, 66
Glee Owen White, son of Carl

and Hazel Goodner White, was
born on a farm in Shelby county,
on Nov. 14, 1910. He died at Jennie
Edmundson Memorial hospital in
Co. Bluffs, on May 5, 1977, at age
66 years, 5 months and 21 days. He
lived on a farm near Tennant, and
attended school in Tennant. In
1925, he moved, with his parents
to Tucson, Ariz., where he at-
tended high school. He moved
back to Harlan, in 1930 and held
various jobs for several years. On
Sept. 16, 1939, he married Elva
Blair at Forest City. They made
their home in Harlan where Glee
was employed as a bus driver for
the Davis Bus Line. In 1948,^)6
became a salesman for the
Moorman Manufacturing Co. and
served in this capacity for 23
years before retiring in Dec. of
1972. Glee joined the Tennant
Methodist church as a youth and
has been a member of the Harlan
First United Methodist church for
many years.

He was preceded in death by
his parents, Carl White in 1932 and
Hazel White Andersen in 1957. His
survivors include his wife, Elva
White, of Harlan; a sister, Aldine
(Mrs Wal lace Inman) of
Hastings, Nebr.; two aunts; an
uncle, nieces and nephews and
other relatives.

Funeral services were held at
Pauley Funeral Home in Harlan
on Saturday, May 7, 1977 with
Rev. Larry LaVelle, pastor of the
First United Methodist church in
Harlan, officiating. Burial was in
the Harlan cemetery with Jake
More, Galen Plumb, Jack Gaskill,
Gaillard Lund, Reese Laughlin,
and Howard W. Pedersen serving
ascasketbearers.


