
THE LIFE STORY OF —

Louise M.
Sunder land, 88

Harlan — Louise Marie
Sunderland, daughter of Hans and
Catherine Ludwicksen Hansen
was born in Harlan on Jan. 9,1891.
She received her schooling in
rural schools and grew to
adulthood on her parent's farm.
On June 26, 1912, she married
Vince Sunderland in Kirkman.
Two daughters were born to this
union.

After their marriage, they
farmed on different farms in
Center twp. before retiring and
moving to Harlan in 1959. After
Mr. Sunderland's death in June of
1968, Louise continued to make
her home in Harlan. She moved to
the Baptist Memorial Home in
1972 and this has been her home
since that time. Mrs Sunderland
died at Myrtue Memorial hospital
in Harlan on Monday, April 9» 1979
at age 88 years and three months.

In addition to her husband,
she was preceded in death by her
parents; a sister, Nickoline Long
and a brother, Lial Hansen. She is
survived by two daughters -
Darrell (Mrs John Mitchell) of
Harlan and Darlene (Mrs Gene
Callender) of Manilla; a one
grandson, Donald Callender of
Atlantic, by a sister, Carrie (Mrs
Charles Brodersen) of the
Friendship Home in Audubon; a
brother, Aimer Hansen of Harlan;
nieces and nephews and other
relatives.

Funeral services were held at
Pauley Funeral Home in Harlan
on Thursday, April 12, 1979 with
Pastor Clifford H. Nelson of the
Immanuel Lutheran church in
Harlan, officiating. Burial was in
the Immanuel Lutheran cemetery
in Kimballton with Lyle Walker,
Elvin Hansen, Gorden Petersen,
Donald Callender, Grant
Christensen, and Duane A.
Christensen serving as casket-
bearers.


