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Elizabeth C.
Kuchel,75

Irwin — Elizabeth Caroline
Kuchel, daughter of Henry and
Bertha Saltwell Meyer, was born
Oct. 6,1902 on a farm southeast of
Manilla. She attended the rural
school near her home and on Dec.
26, 1928 she married Edwin
Kuchel. This union was blessed
with two daughters. After far-
ming near Irwin and Manilla the
family moved to a farm in
Audubon county for eight years
and retired to Manilla in 1970.
Edwin died on Febr. 7, 1977 and
since that time Elizabeth made
her home at the Manilla Manor.
She died Sunday, Nov. 27, 1977 at
the Crawford County Memorial
hospital in Denison at age 75
years, one month and 21 days.

She was preceded in death by
one grandson, her parents and
four brothers. Survivors include
two daughters — Charlyn (Mrs
Amos) Armstrong of Clinton, Mo.
and Janelle (Mrs Tony) Murdock
of Fortune, Calif., four grand-
children and two brothers - Henry
Meyer of Manilla and Louie
Meyer of Grants Pass., Oreg., and
other relatives.

Funeral services were held
Wednesday, Nov. 30, 1977 at
Trini ty Lutheran church in
Manilla with Pastor Victor Hoyer,
officiating. Burial was in the
Nishnabotna cemetery in Manilla
with her nephews serving as
casketbearers.

Ohde Funeral Home in
Manilla was in charge of the
arrangements.


