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Mrs Eloise
Funk/ 92

Persia — Mrs Fred Funk, the
former Eloise McGavern, was
born and raised in Persia. She
married Fred E. Funk of Persia
on Sept. 26, 1906 in Logan. She
died Tues., May 1, 1979 at age 92

i years. They farmed in the Persia
area until 1921 when they moved

I to Littleton, Colo. They operated a
chicken and turkey ranch and Mr
Funk ran a trucking business.
Two months ago she made her
home with her daughter, Mrs
Delores Flint at Lakewood, Colo.

She was preceded in death by
her husband and a daughter, Mrs
Dorothy Eager. Survivors include
four children - Mrs Joe (Vera)
Rose of Loveland, Colo.,
Lawrence Funk and Clifford Funk
of Littleton, Colo., and Mrs
Howard (Delores) Flint of
Lakewood, Colo., 13 grand-
children and seven great gran-
dchildren; a brother - H. L. (Roy)
McGavern of Persia and a sister -
Mrs Lenn (Irene) Munsel of
Houston, Texas.

Funeral services were held
Friday, May 4, 1979 at the Drink-
wine Chapel with Rev. Dan Hiett,
officiating. Burial was in Chapel
Hill cemetery in Littleton with her
grandsons serving as casket-
bearers.


